
 

Nurse Educator - Acute Services 
Mildura Base Public Hospital 
 
 

Mildura Base Public Hospital (MBPH) was established as a new entity in September 2020. MBPH 
is a leading healthcare provider in the north west of Victoria, known for its high level of 
professionalism, quality care and community engagement.  MBPH employs over 900 staff and has 
172 beds and provides a range of acute services in emergency, maternity, intensive care, 
rehabilitation, community services, psychiatric in and out patient care, palliative care, renal dialysis 
and chemotherapy service to the people of North West Victoria. The hospital also provides medical 
imaging and pathology services.  

The Nurse Educator – Acute Services holds a key leadership position in facilitating the development 
of and supporting a culture of continuous learning and enquiry by the Nursing and Midwifery 
workforce at MBPH. You will also collaborate with the People and Culture team to inform the 
development, delivery and evaluation of education resources to meet individual and organisational 
learning and developmental needs, supporting the delivery of a patient centred service that 
embodies evidence-based practice.  This position is a 0.8 full time equivalent role. 

To meet the requirements of this exciting career opportunity, you will hold Post graduate 
qualifications in a relevant speciality, be able to demonstrate advanced clinical knowledge and 
experience in the supervision, mentoring and performance development of staff in an acute care 
clinical setting and have a highly developed communication / interpersonal and problem-solving 
skills. 
 
If you have the background and skills for these exciting roles then we would like to hear from you.  
For more information please visit our website at: 
 

 
 

www.hrsa.com.au 
 
 

or contact Jo Lowday on: 0400 158 155.  To make an application you will be required to submit: a 
Cover Letter incorporating a response to the Key Selection Criteria, your full CV and a completed 
HRS Application Form available on the HRS web site. Applications can be made online or sent by 
email to: hrsa@hrsa.com.au 
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